BID TABULATION
BID # 2021-255
AGGREGATE HAULING VIA BELLY DUMP AND BOBTAIL FOR PCT. 4

PRIMARY ALTERNATE
VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
NAME:|] SHAWN NOEY TRUCKING R CONSTRUCTION COMPANY KNIFE RIVER
ADDRESS: PO BOX 84 PO BOX 189 6310 STATE HWY 21 WEST
MARQUEZ, TX 77865 BUFFALO, TX 75831 BRYAN, TX 77807
TELEPHONE/FAX: 903-391-0174 903-322-4639 979-361-2941
CONTACT: SHAWN NOEY JOEY BREWER JON STOW

ITEM: | DESC: AGGREGATE HAULING BELLY DUMP PER TON BELLY DUMP PER TON BELLY DUMP PER TON
1 |10 MILES OR LESS $5.00 $2.50 NO BID

2 |11 MILES - 15 MILES $5.00 $3.50

3 |16 MILES - 20 MILES $5.00 $4.05

4 |21 MILES - 25 MILES $5.00 $4.50

5 |26 MILES - 30 MILES $5.00 $5.40

6 |31 MILES - 35 MILES $5.50 $6.30

7 |36 MILES - 40 MILES $6.25 $7.20

8 {41 MILES - 45 MILES $7.00 $8.10

9 |46 MILES - 50 MILES $8.00 $9.00

10 |51 MILES - 55 MILES $8.75 $9.90

11 |56 MILES - 60 MILES $9.50 $10.80

12 |61 MILES - 65 MILES $10.50 $11.70

13 |66 MILES - 70 MILES $11.25 $12.60

14 |71 MILES - 75 MILES $12.00 $13.50

15 |76 MILES - 80 MILES $12.75 $14.40

16 |81 MILES - 85 MILES $13.75 $15.30

17 |86 MILES - 90 MILES $14.50 $16.20

18 |91 MILES- 95 MILES $15.50 $17.10

19 {96 MILES - 100 MILES $16.25 $18.00

20 [101 MILES - 105 MILES $17.00 $18.90

21 |106 MILES - 110 MILES $17.75 $19.80

22 |111 MILES - 115 MILES $18.75 $20.70

23 [116 + MILES $20.00 $21.60

Date: July 28, 2021
Commissioner Grimes made the motion to accept Shawn Noey Trucking as Primary and R Construction as

Alternate. Commissioner Workman seconded the motion. Motion carried.



BID TABULATION
BID # 2021-255
AGGREGATE HAULING VIA BELLY DUMP AND BOBTAIL FOR PCT. 4

VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
NAME: SHAWN NOEY R CONSTRUCTION COMPANY KNIFE RIVER
ADDRESS: PO BOX 84 PO BOX 189 6310 STATE HWY 21 WEST
MARQUEZ, TX 77865 BUFFALO, TX 75831 BRYAN, TX 77807
TELEPHONE/FAX: 903-391-0174 903-322-4639 979-361-2941
CONTACT: SHAWN NOEY JOEY BREWER JON STOW

ITEM: | DESC: AGGREGATE HAULING BOBTAIL PER TON BOBTAILPER TON ‘“ . ' ’ BOBTAIL PER TON
1 |10 MILES OR LESS NO BID $4.00 NO BID

2 |11 MILES - 15 MILES $5.25

3 |16 MILES - 20 MILES $7.00

4 |21 MILES - 25 MILES $8.25

5 |26 MILES - 30 MILES $10.50

6 |31 MILES - 35 MILES $12.25

7 |36 MILES - 40 MILES $14.00

8 |41 MILES - 45 MILES $15.75

9 |46 MILES - 50 MILES $17.50

10 |51 MILES - 55 MILES $19.25

11 |56 MILES - 60 MILES $21.00

12 |61 MILES - 65 MILES $22.75

13 |66 MILES - 70 MILES $24.50

14 |71 MILES - 75 MILES $26.25

15 |76 MILES - 80 MILES $28.00

16 |81 MILES - 85 MILES $29.75

17 |86 MILES - 90 MILES $31.50

18 |91 MILES- 95 MILES $33.25

19 |96 MILES - 100 MILES $35.00

20 |101 MILES - 105 MILES $36.75

21 {106 MILES - 110 MILES $38.50

22 |111 MILES - 115 MILES $40.25

23 [116 + MILES $42.00




AGGREGATE HAULING VIA BELLY DUMP AND BOBTAIL FOR PCT. 4

BID TABULATION
BID # 2021-255

VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3

NAME:| SHAWN NOEY TRUCKING | R CONSTRUCTION COMPANY KNIFE RIVER
mem:  DESC: FUEL SURCHARGE (FSC)
5 GALLON/% P01093700 2% NO FUEL SURCHARGE NO BID .
25 GALLON/% $3.110-$3.200  3,0%
26 GALLON/% $3.210-$3.300  3,5%
27 GALLON/% $3.310-$3.400  5,0%
28 GALLON/% $3.410-$3.500  7,0%
29 GALLON/% $3.510-$3.600  9,0%
30 GALLON/% $3.610-$3.700  11,0%
31 GALLON/% $3.710-53.800  13.0%
32 GALLON/% $3.810-$3.900  15.0%
33 GALLON/% $3.910-54.000  20.0%
34 GALLON/% $4.010-34.100  22,0%
35 GALLON/% $4.110-54.200  24.0%
36 GALLON/% $4.210-54.300  26.0%
37 GALLON/% $4.310-54.400  28,0%
38 GALLON/% $4.410-54.500  30,0%
39 GALLON/% $4.510-54.600  32,0%
40 GALLON/% $4.610-54.700 34.0%
41 GALLON/% $4.710-$4.800  36,0%
42 GALLON/% $4.810-54.900  38.0%
43 GALLON/% $4.910-$5.100  40.0%
44 GALLON/%
45 GALLON/%
46 GALLON/%
47 GALLON/%
48 GALLON/%
49 GALLON/%
50 GALLON/%
51 GALLON/%
52 GALLON/%
53 GALLON/%
54 GALLON/%
55 GALLON/%
56 GALLON/%
57 GALLON/%




BID TABULATION
BID # 2021-255
AGGREGATE HAULING VIA BELLY DUMP AND BOBTAIL FOR PCT. 4

VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
NAME:| SHAWN NOEY TRUCKING | R CONSTRUCTION COMPANY KNIFE RIVER
ITEm: |DESC:
MIN. DELIVERY (QTY) NONE NONE NO BID
58
' 3 DAYS UNLESS EMERGENCY
DELIVERY ARO 8 HOURS
59 R SITUATION 0
WHERE DO YOU GET FUEL
PRICES FROM TO CALCULATE KO;’:::;USRTI\JXER’ NA
60 FUEL SURCHARGE FEE? ’
WHEN DO YOU CHECK PRICING
EVE DAY NA
61 (BE SPECIFIC) RY MONDA
NUMBER OF BELLY DUMP(S) 4 3
62 YOUR COMPANY RUNS
WHEN DO YOU BEGIN
CALCULATING MILEAGE? FROM THE PIT FROM THE PIT
63
DO YOU CHARGE DRIVER
64 DETENTION? YES NO
65 IF YES, WHAT IS THE COST? $95/HOUR NA
AT WHAT POINT DO THE
66 CHARGES OCCUR? AFTER 1 HOUR NA
DID VENDOR PROVIDE
E
67 REFERENCES? YES YES
68 EXCEPTIONS: FUEL SURCHARGE SHEET NONE
INCLUDED WITH BID




